
Bid No. 23-22 Bottled Water
Bid Tabulation

Unit Cost 
Per Case 

Total Annual Cost 
(3000 cases)

Unit Cost 
Per Case 

Total Annual Cost 
(3000 cases)

Unit Cost 
Per Case 

Total Annual Cost 
(3000 cases)

Unit Cost 
Per Case 

Total Annual Cost 
(3000 cases)

Unit Cost 
Per Case 

Total Annual Cost 
(3000 cases)

BlueTriton Brands, 
Inc.

Nestle Pure Life 23.7 oz. $9.99 $29,970.00 $10.49 $31,470.00 $10.99 $32,970.00 $11.49 $34,470.00 $11.99 $35,970.00

Emerald Business 
Supply

Deer Park 23.8 oz. $10.69 $32,070.00 $10.99 $32,970.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

 EMSCO Scientific 
Enterprises Inc.

Poland Spring 23.7 oz. $19.15 $57,450.00 $19.72 $20.32 $20.32 $60,960.00 $20.93 $62,790.00 $21.55 $64,650.00

Unit Cost 
Per Case 

Total Annual Cost 
(1000 cases)

Unit Cost 
Per Case 

Total Annual Cost 
(1000 cases)

Unit Cost 
Per Case 

Total Annual Cost 
(1000 cases)

Unit Cost 
Per Case 

Total Annual Cost 
(1000 cases)

Unit Cost 
Per Case 

Total Annual Cost 
(1000 cases)

BlueTriton Brands, 
Inc.

Nestle Pure Life $5.19 $5,190.00 $5.44 $5,440.00 $5.69 $5,690.00 $5.94 $5,940.00 $6.19 $6,190.00

Emerald Business 
Supply

Deer Park $7.50 $7,500.00 $7.99 $7,990.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

 EMSCO Scientific 
Enterprises Inc.

Poland Spring $12.49 $12,490.00 $12.86 $12,860.00 $13.25 $13,250.00 $13.64 $13,640.00 $14.05 $14,050.00

Bidder Brand

16.9 oz Flat/Twist Cap Bottles

Year 2 Year 3
Bidder Brand

Sport Cap Bottles
Year 4 Year 5

** Bids are still being evaluated for responsiveness **
Lowest bid will be determined by the Cost per Case

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5

Year 1 
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