

**The Philadelphia Parking Authority
701 Market Street, Suite 5400
Philadelphia, PA 19106**

**Bid No. 22-19
Bottled Water 2022
Addendum Two**

To: See Email Distribution List
From: Shannon Stewart
Manager of Contract Administration
Date: November 14, 2022
No Pages: 1 plus Exhibit A

This addendum is issued on November 14, 2022 prior to the bid due date to add, delete, modify, clarify and/or to respond to questions submitted by prospective bidders regarding the work included in the above referenced solicitation.

QUESTIONS

1. **Question:** May I please receive a copy of the Previous Bid Award for Bottled Water?

Response: See Exhibit A.

END OF ADDENDUM TWO

Exhibit A
2019 Bid Tabulation

Bid No. 19-19
Bottled Water 2019
Bid Tabulation

	16.9 oz. bottled water with twist cap		Total	20 oz. bottled water with twist cap	Total
Nestle	Year 1	\$3.99	\$15,960.00	\$5.99	\$23,960.00
	Year 2	\$3.99	\$15,960.00	\$5.99	\$23,960.00
	Year 3	\$3.99	\$15,960.00	\$5.99	\$23,960.00
	Total		\$47,880.00		\$71,880.00
WB Mason	Year 1	\$2.32	\$9,280.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Year 2	\$2.37	\$9,480.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Year 3	\$2.42	\$9,680.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Total		\$28,440.00		