Bid No. 22-20
Copy Paper 2022
Bid Tabulation

** Bids are still being evaluated for responsiveness **

Description Emerald WB Mason
Year One 43.18 | S 43.66
Year Two 4518 | S 44.66
8.5 x 11, 20lb, US 96 .
Year Three No Bid| S 45.66
copy paper
Year Four No Bid| S 47.66
Year Five No Bid| S 48.66
. ___________________________|
Year One 69.70 S 62.44
Year Two 71.70 S 63.44
8.5 x 14, 20lb, US 96 .
Year Three No Bid| $ 64.44
copy paper
Year Four No Bid| $ 65.44
Year Five No Bid| $ 66.44
. _________________________|
Year One 64.90 S 51.22
Year Two 66.90 S 52.22
11 x 17, 20lb, US 96 copy ]
Year Three No Bid| $ 53.22
paper
Year Four No Bid| $ 54.22
Year Five No Bid| $ 55.22
. ___________________________|
Year One 68.27 S 47.33
Year Two 69.50 S 48.33
8.5 x 11, 20lb, colored ]
Year Three No Bid| $ 49.33
copy paper
Year Four No Bid| $ 50.33
Year Five No Bid| $ 51.33
. _________________________|
Year One 58.02 S 51.22
Year Two S 52.22
8.5 x 11, 20lb, US 96 59.90
copy, three hole Year Three No Bid| 53.22
punched
Year Four No Bid| $ 54.22
Year Five No Bid| $ 55.22
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