
Bid No. 19-19 
Bottled Water 2019

Bid Tabulation

Total
20 oz. bottled water 

with twist cap Total
Year 1 $3.99 $15,960.00 $5.99 $23,960.00
Year 2 $3.99 $15,960.00 $5.99 $23,960.00
Year 3 $3.99 $15,960.00 $5.99 $23,960.00
Total $47,880.00 $71,880.00
Year 1 $2.32 $9,280.00 No Bid No Bid
Year 2 $2.37 $9,480.00 No Bid No Bid
Year 3 $2.42 $9,680.00 No Bid No Bid
Total $28,440.00

16.9 oz. bottled water with twist 
cap

Nestle

WB Mason
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